FAUQUIER COUNTY GOVERNMENT AND PUBLIC SCHOOLS

PROCUREMENT DIVISION
320 Hospital Drive, Suite 23
Warrenton, Virginia 20186

Phone: 540-422-8353 Fax: 540-422-8355

NOTICE OF CONTRACT RENEWAL

DATE:

COMMODITY NAME:
CONTRACT NUMBER:
CONTRACT PERIOD:
RENEWALS:

CONTRACTOR:
(VN 630622)

PRICING:

TERMS:
FOB

DELIVERY:

June 18, 2019

Arts, Craft & Classroom Supply Services
RFQ 7763A-B

June 15, 2019 through June 14, 2020
Three (3) one-year renewals

Kurtz Bros., Inc.

400 Reed Street

PO Box 392

Clearfield, PA 16830-0392

PH: 800-252-3811 FX: 814-765-8690
Rep: Kurt Murray

PH: 800-252-3811 Ext. 2643

CELL: 540-786-7011

Unit Price = Catalog 124 price less 35% Discount
www.kurtzbros.com

Net 30 Days
Destination

Freight Included; there shall be no additional charge
for inside delivery.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Jesica Wagler, Senior Buyer

Phone: 540-422-8353
Jesica.wagler@wfauquiercounty.gov




INSTRUCTIONS

. Orders: All FCG&PS Using Departments must order services listed by issuing
FCG&PS Purchase Orders per FCG&PS Procurement Procedures Manual. An
extra copy of the Procedures Manual can be obtained by calling Procurement
at (540) 422-8351 or 8352.

. The applicable contract number, vendor number, estimated total dollar
amount (can be done as a “Not to exceed” estimated figure), contact person
with phone number, and billing/delivery address must be shown on each
purchase order for Finance & Contractor use.

. Inspection on delivery and approval of contractor’s invoice is the
responsibility of the receiving using department.

. Any complaint as to quality of goods or services, faulty or delinquent delivery,
or violation of contract provisions by contractor shall be reported to FCG&PS
Procurement for handling with the Contractor. All complaints must be
submitted in writing and can be forwarded to Procurement via email, fax or
courier.

. Pricing: 35% discount off of the current catalog. Kurt Murray will come
to the schools and deliver the most recent catalog with the new market
basket. On-line ordering is available; please contact him to set up your
account. Furniture items need to be quoted, please call, Kurt Murray,
before purchase order is typed up and sent to Procurement.



VENDOR NAME: _Kuriz Bros., Inc

*Unit Price = Catalog 124 price less 35% discount

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST EST UNIT EXTENDED
aQry | UmNIT PRICE PRICE

CDLOR]NG PACK Wi \-"AR,IDI.I'S COLORS (COUNI'HII'II'J

Brand Name: Crayola Item# _43088 100 BoXx |s 51.97 5 5197.00
MARKERS [PK/12) Crayola® Classic Markers or Equal

2
Brand Name: _Crayocla Item# 08238 100 PK_[5 383 § 393.00
COLORED PENCILS (BOX/24) Cravola® Colored Pencils or Equal

3 | Brand Name: _Crayola Item# _ 06633

100 BOX |s 4.06 5§ 406.00

OIL PASTELS CLASSPACK (SET/336) Cravola® Qil Pastels
| ™ or Equal

Brand Name: _Crayola tem& 49015

75 SET |5 3897 |$2922.75

SIDEWALK CHALK (RiR) Cravola® Sidewalk Chalk Fun
Bucket or Equal pk/d8

Brand Name; _ Crayola Item# _ 09088

50 PK |5 601 s 300.50

WASHABLE TEMPORA PAINT
16 03, Cravola® Washable Ppint or Equal

Brand Name: _Crayola Anista [} ltlem# __ 485610

- 75 EA (5 308 § 231.75
ACRYLICS PAINT (PK/M) Color Splash!® Acrvlic Pgint (4 Pack
32-0z) Set with Pump Or Equs|
7
Brand Name: _ No Bid Hem#
100+ PK_|S 5
WASHABLE WATERCOLORS (SET/16) Crayola® Washable
Watescolors or Equal
]
Brand Name; _Crayola ltem# __44016

wo | ser |s 367 |g 367.00

FINGER PAINT (Sabi) Cravola® Finger Paint Primary Colors or
Equal 3/sel

Brand Name: _Crayola Mem# __ 43688

50 SET |$ 8.03 3 _401.50

FINGER PAINT (igbldtt Cravola® Finger Paint, Secondarv Colors
orEqusl 3/set

Brand Name: Craycla ltem# __ 43689

50 SET |5 8.03 s 401.50

ARTS, CRAFTS & CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
RFP RFQ 7763
Page 12l 36
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*Unit Price = Catalog 124 price less 35% discount

GLUE STICKS (PKJ/30) Elmer's® Glue Sticks or Equal
Brand Name: _Elmer's Herm# 18106

PK

12.61 s 1261.00

WHITE GLUE Elmer's® Whilg Glue — Gallon Size (128 oz.) or
Equal

12
GLITTER GLUE (SET/72) Color Splash!® Glitier Glue Pens or
13
Brand Name: Pacon 42320
and Hame — o | SeT |s 3159 |s 3159.00
TACKY GLUE Color Spiash!® Ulirs Tackv All Purpose Crafl Glue,
- $oz or Equal
+ Aleene's 18059
Brand Natlw. Item# = EA 280 s 280,00
CRAFTSTICKS 38" x 4-1/2". (BOX/1,000)
15
Brand Name; Dapperall Braiding Co ltem# __41333 so | Box |s 410 |s 20500
COLORED CRAFTSTICKS =~ REGULAR (PK/500)
16
Brand Name: ___Darice ltem# __ 41366 50 - 8.22 s 411.00
PLAY DOUGH/CLAY Cravola® Air-Dry Clav, 251b Classpack™ or
17
Brand Name: _Crayola item# 90551
50 EA 3195 |5 1597.50
s CLAY MOLDS AND TOOLS (SET/149) Creativity Streei or Equal
No Bid 50 SET 5
INK PADS (PR/12) Color Splashi® Washable Color lok Pads ot
19
Brand Name: _No Bid Item#
50 PK 5
STAMPS (SET/10) Number Stamps (numbers 0-9. Size: | -5/8" high.)
0 | Brand Name: __No Bid ltem#
50 SET s
GLITTER Color Splash!® Glirier 11b, Shaker Top or Equal
21| Brand Name: Charles Leonard jems#t 42125
Plaase Spacify Color 100 EA 582 5 582.00
VARN Color Splash!® Acrvlic Yam 30z or Equal
22 | Brand Name: _No Bid ltemi
B wo | EA 5
PIPE CLEANERS (PE1000) ille
23 | Brand Name: Charles Leonard jema 42058
100 PK 13.59 |s 135.90

KURTZ BROS

ARTS, CRAFTS & CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
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*Unit Price = Catalog 124 price less 35% discount

FOAM SHEETS (PK/78) 9" x 12" EVA Foam Sheets (Zmm Thick,
assorted colors or Equal
24
Brand Name:  No Bid liem#
100 PE |§ 5
SCISSORS (PK/12) Fiskars® Scissors for Kids or Equal
25 | Brand Name: Fiskars 9501 hem# 10330 - Blunt
50 FK § 2587 § 1298.50
GAMES
MANCALA
26 Brand Name: Continuum Games Hem# 30150
10 EA s 11.83 § 118,30
CONNECT FOUR
27 | Brand Name: Everest Toys lem# _ 24808
10 EA |5 1570 |5 157.00
SORRY
28 | Brand Name: _EverestToys  pems 30182
10 EA |S 1502 |5 150.20
APPLES TO APPLES
| Brand Name: __No Bid Hem#
0 EA |5 5
LEGOS
30 Brand Name:  No Bid ltem#
50 Pk 5 ¥
_ s s
SPECIFIC KITS 5 5
TIE-DYE KITS
31 )
Brand Name: Duncan Enterprises jlem# 54002 : ek |s B84 s 3536
5 5
Di TIO! s .
LATEX BALLODNS 184/pkg
W)
#2 | Brand Name: Hyaigss Products _ llem# __4139
100 BAG |35 14.04 § 1404.00
[ b
ARTS & CRAFTS s s
FUSE BEADS
3| grand MName: No Bid ltem#
5000 BAG |§ 5
WOOD BEADS
34| Brand Name: Charles Leonard  pem# 42093
600 BAG |5 12.3B ¢ 7428.00
ARTS, CRAFTS & CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
RFP RFQ 77563
KURTZ BROS Page 340138




*Unit Price = Catalog 124 price less 35% discount

GLASS BEADS
35
Brand Name: _No Bid em# 50 BAG | S 5
MOSAIC BEADS
36 .
Bid
Brand Name: No lem# 50 BAG | s s
PAPER BEADS
37| Brand Name: __No Bid lemd
500 | BAG |S 5
LEATHER BEADS
3% | Brand Name: _No Bid Itern#t
500 BAG | § 5
ALPHABET BEADS
39 Brand Name: Royico Hem# 55260
s00 | BAG |5 16.06 |5 8030.00
VARIOUS JEWELRY FINDINGS
40| Brand Name: _No Bid Nerm
VARIES | BAG | s
AIR DRY CLAY 2.5lb white
41| Brand Name: _Crayola lem# __ 55052
55 | pox |s 484 |s 121.00
MODEL MAGIC 2Ib while
42 Brand Name: Crayola hem# 55189
_ > | Box |s 1924 |s 3848
DECORATIVE DUCK TAPE - Hoot Dwis
43 | Brand Mame: Shurtach Brands  jlem# 12358
ROLL | PK |s 423 |s
S00% WEIGHT SULFITE PAPER 781> 9x12
M| Brand Name; Tru-Ray lem# __ 37028 SOsht pk
WsH | PK s 215 s
FINGER PAINTS (VARIOUS COLORS) 16 OZ
45 | Brand Name; Rich Art Hems# _46352
160Z | BOT |s 211 |5
FADELESS CONSTRUCTION PAPER 12x18
46 | Brand Name; Pacon Hem# __ 38201
B 6osH | Pk |s 1524 |s
HEAVY WHITE TAG BOARD 0x12
47 Brand Name: Pacon ltem# _ 57255
100 FK 5 4.52 L1
SUPER BRIGHT TAG BOARD
4% | Brand Name: Pacon ltemy# 40548
w0 | Pk |s1167 |s
ARTS, CRAFTS & CLASSROOM SUPPLIES
RFP RFQ 7763
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*Unit Price = Calalog 124 price less 35% discount

CANVAS
49 | Brand Name: _ No Bid llem#
DS ROLL §
PAINT BRUSHES
Rayal Langnickel
50 | Brand Name: __Brushes tem# _ 57836
24 PK 10.53 $
FOAM SHAPE STICKERS
51| Brand Name; _Pacon llem# 41329
VAR PK 13.10
FELT (9212 SHEETS)
52 Brand Name: Pacon hemt S7231
25 PK 11.05 5
POM FOMS Asstd 1" - S0ipkg
53 Brand Name: Charles Leonard  jjemz 42066
802 PK 182 |s
TISSUE PATER
54 | Brand Name: _Pacon ltem# 38087
100SH | PK 1742 |S
MAGNETS 30ipkg
55 | Brand Name: Charles Leonard  jem#t 11441
VAR PK 3.54 [

KURTZ BROS
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