
LOUDOUN COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 
DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS & FINANCIAL SERVICES 

PROCUREMENT AND RISK MANAGEMENT 
21000 Education Court, Suite #301 

Ashburn, VA 20148 
Phone (571) 252-1270 Fax (571) 252-1432

May 1, 2025    

Contract Information 
Title: Art Equipment and Supplies for New Schools and 

Ongoing Needs 

IFB/RFP Number: IFB I25317 

Supersedes: IFB I24328 

Vendor Name: See attached Vendor List for Multiple awards 

Debarment Form: Required: No Form on File: Not Applicable 

Contractor Certification: 
Virginia Code 22.1-296.1 
…the school board shall require the 
contractor to provide certification 
that all persons who will provide 
such services have not been 
convicted of a felony or any offense 
involving the sexual molestation or 
physical or sexual abuse or rape of a 
child. 

Required: Yes Form on File: Yes 

Pricing: See attached Pricing Sheet(s) 

Contract Period: May 1, 2025 through April 30, 2026 

Contract Renewal 
Number: 

New 

4 4 

Procurement Contact: Brandon Grayson 

Procurement Director: Andrea Philyaw 



LOUDOUN COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 
DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS & FINANCIAL SERVICES 

PROCUREMENT AND RISK MANAGEMENT 
21000 Education Court, Suite #301 

Ashburn, VA 20148 
Phone (571) 252-1270 Fax (571) 252-1432

April 20, 2025 

NOTICE OF AWARD 

IFB #I25317 
ART EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES FOR ONGOING NEEDS 

Loudoun County Public Schools awards IFB #I25317 Art Equipment and Supplies for Ongoing Needs as 
per the attached staff recommendation effective May 1, 2025 through April 30, 2026. 

Award is being made to the lowest responsible and responsive bid on the specified items or acceptable 
substitute. No bids were received for items: # 14, 35, 40, 49, 62, 89, 106, 113, 142, 143, 148, 158, 168, 170, 
181, 190, 196, and 210. No Award was issued for line item # 27, 32, 104, 198, and 207. Line items 212-214 
were grouped together.  

We appreciate your interest in being of service to Loudoun County Public Schools. 

Records for this procurement are now available for inspection by appointment. For additional 
information, contact the Procurement Official listed on this solicitation. 

    Andrea Philyaw  
Procurement and Risk Management 
Director 



LOUDOUN COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
IFB #I25317

AWARD

Line UOM Description Manufacturer Manuf. Number Award Price Awarded Supplier

1 EA
APRON, DESIGN YOUR OWN, MEDIUM, 20 X 29 IN., 
WHITE, 1 POCKET SAX 1389274 $6.67 School Specialty, LLC

2 EA
APRON, WHEEL THROWERS-25 IN. X 35 IN. LENGTH-
DENIM CREATIVITY STREET AC5243 $7.74 School Specialty, LLC

3 EA ART PAPER ROLL, 40 LB, 36 IN. X 1000 FT., TAN DIXON/PACON P5736 $40.49 KURTZ BROS INC
4 EA ART PAPER ROLL, 50 LB, 36 IN. X 1000 FT., BLACK ARTKRAFT DUOFINISH 0067301 $63.68 Cascade School Supplies

5 RL ART PAPER ROLL, 50 LB, 36 IN. X 1000 FT., WHITE
AMERICAN PAPER 
CONVERTERS 5WH $61.01 School Specialty, LLC

6 EA DIFFERENT BRAND AMERICAN PAPER #5LBL 39287 $75.42 KURTZ BROS INC

7 EA ART PAPER ROLL, HEAVY WEIGHT, 36 in. x 1000 ft. PINK ARTKRAFT DUOFINISH 0067261 $69.92 Cascade School Supplies

8 EA
ART PAPER ROLL, HEAVY WEIGHT, 36 in. x 1000 ft. 
PURPLE PACON 6330 $64.69 Cascade School Supplies

9 EA
ART ROLLS, HEAVY DUTY WEIGHT (50LB.) 36 IN. x 500 
FT., BLUE AMERICAN PAPER K174 $40.98 Cascade School Supplies

10 EA
ART ROLLS, HEAVY DUTY WEIGHT (50LB.) 36 IN. x 500 
FT., CANARY AMERICAN PAPER K180 $44.73 Cascade School Supplies

11 EA ALTERNATE COLOR--EMERALD GREEN AMERICAN PAPER #5GRD 39233 $39.54 KURTZ BROS INC

12 EA
ART ROLLS, HEAVY DUTY WEIGHT (50LB.) 36 IN. x 500 
FT., ORANGE AMERICAN PAPER K166 $44.07 Cascade School Supplies

13 EA
DIFFERENT BRAND/COLOR
FLAME RED AMERICAN PAPER #5FRO-D 39227 $49.49 KURTZ BROS INC

14 Set ART VISUALS, ELEMENTS OF ART AND PRINCIPALS OF CRYSTAL CP6061
15 EA AWT PORTABLE DRYING RACK - 18" X 24", 50 SHELVES AWT $1,772.26 Nasco Education LLC
16 EA AWT PORTABLE DRYING RACK - 20" X 26", 40 SHELVES AWT $1,568.01 Nasco Education LLC
17 KIT BATIK, CLASSROOM KIT NASCO 9736474 $472.30 Nasco Education LLC
18 EA MANIKIN LIFELIKE ARTISTS 12 MALE JACK RICHESON 710112 $5.12 Nasco Education LLC
19 EA BONE FOLDER - 6" LENGTH FISKARS 157650-1001 $3.72 School Specialty, LLC

20 EA
BOTTLE, REFILLABLE SPRAY, WITH TRIGGER 
SPRAYER, 32 OUNCES, CLEAR $1.64 School Specialty, LLC

21 EA
BRAYER, SPEEDBALL 2 IN. SOFT RUBBER ON METAL 
CORE. PLASTIC HANDLE; SPEEDBALL SPEEDBALL #004171 $10.80 Nasco Education LLC

22 EA
BRAYER, SPEEDBALL 4 IN. SOFT RUBBER ON METAL 
CORE. PLASTIC HANDLE; SPEEDBALL SPEEDBALL #004126 $12.63 KURTZ BROS INC

23 EA
BRAYER, SPEEDBALL 6 IN. SOFT RUBBER ON METAL 
CORE. PLASTIC HANDLE SPEEDBALL 041229 $12.61 School Specialty, LLC

24 EA
BROOM, 1 IN. DIAMETER JUMBO SMOOTH ANGLE, 
FLAGGED POLYPROPYLENE FILL

COASTWIDE 
PROFESSIONAL 24420007 $18.51 School Specialty, LLC

25 SET

BRUSH, CANISTER SET INCLUDES 24 EACH OF 4, 6, 8 
SIZED FLAT AND 1, 3, 5 SIZED ROUND, SHORT 
HANDLES, GOLDEN TAKLON BRISTLES, 144 PER SET DYNASTY

B-400
$140.80 Nasco Education LLC

26 EA

Westcott wooden dusting brush
https://www.dickblick.com/items/westcott-wooden-dusting-
brush/ Westcott

21578-1001
$5.73 BLICK ART MATERIALS

27 Set
BRUSH, DYNASTY B-420 CYLINDER SET OF 72, ANGLES 
& FILBERTS. DYNASTY DYNASTY

28 EA
BRUSH, FINE BAMBOO HANDLE WATERCOLOR PAINT 
BRUSH SIZE 4 SAX 463544 $0.51 School Specialty, LLC

29 PKG
BRUSH, FLAT, NON-TOXIC STUBBY PLASTIC HANDLE, 7-
1/2 IN, ASSORTED COLOR, PACK OF 10 SCHOOL SMART 85680 $3.45 School Specialty, LLC

30 EA
BRUSH, HOG BRISTLE BRUSH, FLAT, LONG HANDLE, 
SIZE 6 WINSOR &  NEWTON 5974706 $4.45 BLICK ART MATERIALS

31 EA
BRUSH, NATURAL BRISTLE SERIES, SIZE 1 (1/4 IN.) 
BRIGHT

PRINCETON ASHLEY 
SERIES 5200 $2.65 BLICK ART MATERIALS

32 PKG

BRUSH, OIL. SIZE 1 IN. ACRYLIC FILAMENT EASEL 
BRUSH. FLAT HEAD, FASTENED IN FLAT SEAMLESS 
ALUM. FERRULES. LONG HARDWOOD HANDLE. 
PACKAGE OF 3 SAX OPTIMUM

1567533

33 PKG

BRUSH, OIL. SIZE 1/2 IN. ACRYLIC FILAMENT EASEL 
BRUSH. FLAT HEAD, FASTENED IN FLAT SEAMLESS 
ALUM. FERRULES. LONG HARDWOOD HANDLE. 
PACKAGE OF 3 SAX OPTIMUM

1567584

$1.39 School Specialty, LLC

34 EA
BRUSH, OIL. SIZE 2 - BRIGHT. 1/4 IN. PRINCETON 
SERIES 5200 ASHLEY NATURAL BRISTLE BRIGHT

PRINCETON ASHLEY 
SERIES 5200 $2.95 BLICK ART MATERIALS

35 PKG
BRUSH, OLYMPIA WHITE INTERLOCKED HOG BRISTLE, 
FLAT, SIZE 4, PACK OF 3 SAX 1440155

36 PKG
BRUSH, OPTIMUM GOLDEN SYNTHETIC TAKLON, FLAT, 
1 IN., PACK OF 3 SAX 1567533 $2.43 School Specialty, LLC

37 PKG
BRUSH, OPTIMUM GOLDEN SYNTHETIC TAKLON, 
ROUND, SIZE 2, PACK OF 6 SAX 1567607 $1.42 School Specialty, LLC

38 PKG
BRUSH, OPTIMUM GOLDEN SYNTHETIC TAKLON, 
ROUND, SIZE 8, PACK OF 6 SAX 1567610 $2.03 School Specialty, LLC

39 SET
BRUSH, OPTIMUM WHITE SYNTHETIC TAKLON, 
ASSORTED SIZES, SET OF 72 SAX 404679 $42.05 School Specialty, LLC

40 SET

BRUSH, PACK SERIES RCAN-4, WHITE, FLAT BRISTLE, 
SQUARE-ENDED FOR OIL AND ACRYLIC PAINTING 
W/PURE WHITE HOG BRISTLE, SHORT HANDLES, 6 
SIZES, 24/SIZE, SET OF 144 ROYAL BRUSH

90672061881

41 SET
BRUSH, RED SYNTHETIC DETAIL SPOTTER, ASSORTED 
SIZES, BLACK, SET OF 6 SAX 411572 $2.93 School Specialty, LLC

42 SET

BRUSH, ROUND TIP STUBBY WHITE HOG BRISTLE 
WOOD HANDLE EASEL BRUSH SET, 7-1/2 IN., 
ASSORTED COLOR, SET OF 10 SCHOOL SMART

85682
$3.13 School Specialty, LLC

43 SET

BRUSH, ROYAL & LANGNICKEL CLEAR CHOICE TYNEX 
BRUSH SET OF 60, ROUNDS, LONG HANDLE: ROYAL & 
LANGNICKEL ROYAL & LANGNICKEL $46.20 BLICK ART MATERIALS

44 SET

BRUSH, ROYAL & LANGNICKEL CLEAR CHOICE TYNEX 
BRUSH SET OF 60,FLATS, LONG HANDLE: ROYAL & 
LANGNICKEL ROYAL & LANGNICKEL $46.20 BLICK ART MATERIALS

45 PACK
BRUSH, ROYAL BRUSH SOFT-GRIP 72 BRUSH CLASS 
PACKS, FLATS, SHORT HANDLE: ROYAL & LANGNICKEL ROYAL & LANGNICKEL $88.14 School Specialty, LLC

46 PACK

BRUSH, ROYAL BRUSH SOFT-GRIP 72 BRUSH CLASS 
PACKS, ROUNDS, SHORT HANDLE: ROYAL & 
LANGNICKEL ROYAL & LANGNICKEL $88.14 School Specialty, LLC

47 PACK

BRUSH, ROYAL BRUSH SOFT-GRIP 72 BRUSH CLASS 
PACKS, SHADERS AND ROUNDS, SHORT HANDLE: 
ROYAL & LANGNICKEL ROYAL & LANGNICKEL $88.14 School Specialty, LLC

48 EA
BRUSH, SIZE 3" LIQUITEX SERIES 13008; BROAD FLAT 
LONG HANDLE LIQUITEX 1300803 $17.68 BLICK ART MATERIALS

49 SET
BRUSH, UTILITY BRUSH. WHITE TAKLON, ASSORTED 
SET OF 3; ROYAL ROYAL

50 SET

ROYAL & LANGNICKEL AQUA-FLO BRUSH CLASS PACK 
OF 36, INCLUDES 12 EACH OF SMALL, MEDIUM, & 
LARGE. SYNTHETIC TAKLON ROYAL & LANGNICKEL

AQUAFLOBOX-36
$38.20 School Specialty, LLC

51 SET

BRUSHES, OLYMPIA INTERLOCKED HOG HAIR BRISTLE 
LONG HANDLE PAINT BRUSHES, ASSORTED SIZES, SET 
OF 6 SAX

411569
$9.51 School Specialty, LLC

52 EA BRUTE 32 GALLON LID, GRAY RUBBERMAID 2631GY $17.08 School Specialty, LLC
53 EA BRUTE DOLLY, BLACK RUBBERMAID 2640BK $38.78 Quill LLC
54 EA BRUTE, VENTED BRUTE 32 GALLON, GRAY RUBBERMAID SKU FG263200 GRAY $50.82 Quill LLC

55 EA

BUCKET, BRUTE DURABLE FLEXIBLE UTILITY BUCKET, 
10 QUART, 10/5 x 10-1/4 INCHES, PLASTIC-ZINC PLATED 
HANDLE, GRAY RUBBERMAID

3963GY
$14.44 Quill LLC

56 KIT

BUTTON AND BADGE MAKER, MAKES 2-1/4 IN. 
BUTTONS. 100 BUTTON BACKS, MYLAR DISKS, WHITE 
PAPER CIRCLES. 1 YR. WARR. NEIL ENTERPRISES

913MM
$295.10 School Specialty, LLC

57 PKG
CADDY, 3 COMPARTMENT, 9-1/4 X 9-1/4 X 5-1/4 IN., 
ASSORTED COLORS, CASE OF 6 STOREX 00940U06C $12.10 School Specialty, LLC

58 EA CANVAS 63 IN. 10 OZ, UNPRIMED BLICK $4.39 BLICK ART MATERIALS
59 RL CANVAS, COTTON CANVAS BY THE YARD 12oz BLICK $3.62 BLICK ART MATERIALS

60 EA

CART, BRENT WARE W/SHELVES. 12 SHELVES MADE 
OF EXTERIOR GRADE PLYWOOD. SHELF SIZE 32-1/2 IN. 
X 12-1/4 IN.- 1 IN. STEEL PIPE W/ WELDED ON SHELF 
SUPPORTS. 77 IN. H X 32 IN. W X 24 IN. D. 4 TIRES 
W/SWIVEL CASTERS BRENTWARE

22832J

$1,267.28 Nasco Education LLC

61 EA

CART, RUBBERMAID SERVICE CART--SOLID 
DURAMOLD, TWO FIXED WHEELS, TWO SWIVEL 
CASTERS, 33 IN. X 25.5 IN. X 40.5 IN. UP TO 400 LBS. 
BEIGE RUBBERMAID

452088BG

$241.21 Quill LLC

62 SET
CARVING TOOL SET, HIGH GRADE STEEL, WOODEN 
LACQUERED HANDLE, SET OF 6 UJ RAMELSON SKU: 8D-W1VR-SIHO

63 EA
CLAY SLICER, ADJUSTABLE HANDLED, STAINLESS 
STEEL AMACO 11070A 11070A $14.30 School Specialty, LLC

64 EA CLEAN-UP TOOL KIT JACK RICHESON 210509 $19.60 Nasco Education LLC
65 EA CLIPS, 3 INCH BULL DOG CLIPS - 12/ BOX CASCADE 119024 $3.01 Cascade School Supplies
66 SET COLOR WHEEL, CLASSROOM SET OF 30 JACK RICHESON 499975 $7.20 School Specialty, LLC

67 EA COLOR WHEEL, DURABLE VIEWCATCHER, 3-1/2 IN.
THE COLOR WHEEL 
COMPANY $3.90 School Specialty, LLC

68 EA
COLOR WHEEL, GIANT. COLOR MIXING.COLOR 
HARMONY. WITH PRIMARY AND SECONDARY COLORS JACK RICHESON 499970 $7.23 BLICK ART MATERIALS

69 EA
Blick item #55437-0000 
https://www.dickblick.com/items/safe-t-safe-t-compass/ Learning Resource 45760 $0.86 BLICK ART MATERIALS

70 EA COPING SAW, 4 1/2 IN. NICHOLSON COPING SAW STANLEY 846892 $6.69
MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY 
PRODUCTS

71 SET

CREATIVITY STREET NO-SPILL ROUND CUP PLASTIC 
PAINT POT SET WITH WHITE LIDS, 3 IN. WIDE, 
TRANSLUCENT, SET OF 10 CREATIVITY STREET

AC5101
$6.89 School Specialty, LLC

72 PKG CUTTER, LINOLEUM, NO. #1 SMALL LINER, PACK OF 12 SPEEDBALL 004101 $12.48 Cascade School Supplies

73 EA
CUTTER, LOGAN SIMPLEX ELITE 40 IN. MAT CUTTER. 
W/27 IN. SQUARING ARM LOGAN 750-1 $390.92 BLICK ART MATERIALS

74 EA
D&K 210M COMMERCIAL DRY MOUNTING PRESS - 18.5 x 
23" D&K MFR #SE1403 $2,935.00 BLICK ART MATERIALS

75 EA DECORATING WHEEL, HEAVY DUTY, 8 IN. JACK RICHESON 400255 $10.30 School Specialty, LLC
76 EA DEEP 6-WELL PAINTING TRAY, SIZE: 11 in. x 7-1/4 IN. RICHESON 101012 $2.16 Nasco Education LLC

No Award

No Bid

No Award

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



LOUDOUN COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
IFB #I25317

AWARD

Line UOM Description Manufacturer Manuf. Number Award Price Awarded Supplier

77 EA

DIVERSIFIED WOODCRAFTS PEDESTAL ART TABLE, 60 
X 42 X 26 IN., NATURAL BIRCH LAMINATE TOP, BASE IS 
CONSTRUCTED OF TWO TAPERED SOLID MAPLE 
PEDISTAL STYLE PANEL LEGS AND TWO SOLID MAPLE 
TRUSS BARS. ASSEMBLY REQUIRED DIVERSIFIED

PT-62PNB26

$1,245.00 BLICK ART MATERIALS

78 EA

DIVERSIFIED WOODCRAFTS PEDESTAL ART TABLE, 60 
X 42 X 30 IN., NATURAL BIRCH LAMINATE TOP, BASE IS 
CONSTRUCTED OF TWO TAPERED SOLID MAPLE 
PEDISTAL STYLE PANEL LEGS AND TWO SOLID MAPLE 
TRUSS BARS. ASSEMBLY REQUIRED DIVERSIFIED

PT-62PNB

$1,229.00 BLICK ART MATERIALS

79 EA
DOUBLE SIDED DRYING RACK, 20 x 32 x 26-1/4 IN., 40 
PAINTINGS COPERNICUS PDR40 $237.98 School Specialty, LLC

80 SET

DRILL, DEWALT 20V MAX 1/2 IN. COMPACT CORDLESS 
DRILL  (INCLUDES TWO 20V BATERIES (DCB203), 
CHARGER, BELT HOOK AND CASE DEWALT

DCD780C2
$227.34

MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY 
PRODUCTS

81 EA
DRYING RACK, COPERNICUS SPRING LOADED DRYING 
RACK, 26 1/2 X 25 X 47 1/2 INCHES, 20 SHELVES COPERNICUS $283.21 School Specialty, LLC

82 EA

DRYING RACK, PRINTMAKING, 37 x 23 x 20 IN., WELDED 
STEEL WITH POWDER COATING, 100 SHELVES 10 x 18 
IN., 50 PER SIDE, SPACED 1 IN. APART AWT

DR-18-100

$780.00 BLICK ART MATERIALS
83 EA DUSTPAN, HEAVY DUTY, 12-1/4 IN. WIDE, PLASTIC RUBBERMAID 2005CH $5.69 Quill LLC
84 EA EASEL, CLASSIC 500 SERIES, ALUMINUM, 48 IN. TESTRITE 500 Series $97.21 School Specialty, LLC
85 EA EASEL, SUPERIOR STUDIO ALUMINUM EASEL 1450 TESTRITE TRADITIONAL 1450 $132.89 School Specialty, LLC

86 EA

EASEL, TABLE, 22 IN x 14 IN x 14 IN, OPEN WIDTH OF 20 
IN WITH WINGS EXTENDED, ALUMINUM, ANGLE 
ADJUSTMENT, WEIGHTS 2 LB, FOLDS COMPACTLY TO 
FIT IN INCLUDED SMALL BAG WITH SHOULDER STRAP

MARTIN UNIVERSAL 
DESIGN ANGELINA

92-AE010

$30.25 BLICK ART MATERIALS

87 SET

ELEMENTS OF ART & PRINCIPLES OF DESIGN 16 
POSTER SET (PAPER, 13 X 19), THE LEARNING PLACE 
STORE, ART16

THE LEARNING PLACE 
STORE $41.10 Ink Systems LLC

88 SET

ETCHING SETS, INTAGLIO, 4 PIECE ROUTLETTE SET, 
INCLUDES A SCRAPER/BURNISHER, ROULETTE DOT 85, 
TWISTED DOUBLE POINT SCRIBE, AND BURIN SQUARE 
MEDIUM, LYONS LYONS $67.34 BLICK ART MATERIALS

89 EA

EXTRUDER, EXPANDED, PACKAGE TO INCLUDE 
STAINLESS STEEL EXTRUDER W/BASIC DIE SET 915 & 
EXPANSION BOX PACKAGE W/ MEDIUM BASIC DIE SET 
991

NORTH STAR EQUIPMENT, 
INC

950-EX Expanded 
Package

90 SET

FILES, 8-PC STEEL RIFFLER SET. HAND-FORGED. DBL-
SIDED, 8 IN. LONG FORGED STEEL RASPS. INCL. 
CARRYING CASE JACK RICHESON

210590
$22.60 Nasco Education LLC

91 PKG

FRAMES, PICTURE. QUICK RELEASE FEATURE. 
NONGLARE PANEL REV. BLACK WHITE MAT PAPER. 
FRAME BLACK FINISH. 18in. X 24in. 6 PK LEADER $355.76 Nasco Education LLC

92 PAIR
GLOVES, HEAT RESISTANT, LEATHER, COWHIDE, FULL 
COTTON, ONE PAIR, ONE SIZE STEINER 2119B $13.39

MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY 
PRODUCTS

93 EA
GLUE GUN, ESSENTIALS SERIES, 10 WATT, MINI SIZE, 
LOW TEMPERATURE SUREBONDER LT-160 $3.26 KURTZ BROS INC

94 BOX GLUE STICKS, MINI SIZE, 4 IN. CLEAR, 5 LB BOX SUREBONDER 725M54 $21.99 KURTZ BROS INC

95 EA GOGGLE, 810 SERIES, DIRECT VENT, 687836 RADIANS GGP11VID $1.91
MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY 
PRODUCTS

96 EA

GOGGLES. INFRARED GLASSES W/A FLOP-FRONT 
COBALT BLUE LENS. FILTERS 70 PERC. INFRARED 
RAYS/99.9 PERC. ULTRAVIOLET RADIATION. MOLDED-IN-
BROW-BAND. SIDE SHIELDS IN OPAQUE BLACK FRAME FORNEY

53320, 409928

$16.26
MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY 
PRODUCTS

97 EA HAMMER WOOD HANDLE RIP CLAW, 16 OZ STANLEY PO51-716 $10.16 School Specialty, LLC
98 EA HAMMER. WOOD HANDLE CURVED CLAW, 16 OZ STANLEY PO51-616 $8.60 School Specialty, LLC
99 EA HOLE PUNCH, BOSTITCH EZSQUEEZE 3-HOLE PUNCH AMAX STANLEY BOSTITCH 2101 $9.49 Cascade School Supplies

100 PKG
HOOKS FOR SUSPENDED CEILINGS, SOLD EACH 
PRICED 10/PK CASCADE BRAND 026461 $6.20 Cascade School Supplies

101 EA
INKING PLATE. COMBINATION INKING PLATE/BENCH 
HOOK. METAL W/LIP TO FIT OVER DESK. 7 IN X 9 IN. INOVART 5900 $5.77 School Specialty, LLC

102 PKG
INK-MIXING TRAY. FLEXIBLE, HEAVY-GAUGE, CLEAR 
PLASTIC. 10PK. 6-1/2 IN X 6-1/2 IN W/WALLS SCHOOL SMART 090907 $2.79 School Specialty, LLC

103 EA KILN DRY FORM SHELF WASH, 4 LB. AMACO 52777L $18.74 BLICK ART MATERIALS

104 EA
INKING PLATE. COMBINATION INKING PLATE/BENCH 
HOOK. METAL W/LIP TO FIT OVER DESK. 7 IN X 9 IN. INOVART 5900

105 EA

KILN SKUTT MODEL 1227, 3 IN. FURNITURE KIT, 8 - 5/8 
INCH HALF SHELVES WITH A 1-1/2 IN. LARGE POST 
ASSORTMENT SKUTT

MODEL 1227-3in.
$807.69 School Specialty, LLC

106 EA

KILN, ENAMELING, PORTABLE. USES ANY 15-AMP, 120V 
CIRCUIT AND VARIABLE SPEED INPUT CONTROL. 
CHAMBER SIZE: 5-3/4 W X 6-1/4 IN H X 6 IN D. COLOR: 
GRAY. (Q-11A XPRESS-Q-11A PARAGON MFG# Q-11A) PARAGON

Q-11A

107 EA Sculpey Clay Extruder with 19 pattern discs SCULPEY ACG1 $11.82 BLICK ART MATERIALS

108 EA
KNIFE, CERAMIC CRAFT KNIFE WITH SAFETY CAP, 
SLICE SKU #10589 SLICE SKU #10589 $10.91 BLICK ART MATERIALS

109 EA

KNIFE, CUTTING. NO. 2. ALL-ALUM. BODY. KNURLED, 4-
WAY NONSLIP CHUCK. PLASTIC TUBE FOR STORAGE. 
SAFETY CAP X-ACTO

X3602
$4.96 School Specialty, LLC

110 EA
KNIFE FETTLING, Thin flexible tapered steel for cutting and 
trimming wet clay. RICHESON 400303 $4.17 Cascade School Supplies

111 EA
KNIFE, SAFETY KNIFE, RETRACTABLE W/3 EXTRA 
BLADES, 3 LOCKING POSITIONS GREAT NECK SAW MANF. 12243 $3.45 KURTZ BROS INC

112 PKG KNIFE, X-ACTO NO.2 (BLADES) X-ACTO X202 $2.60 School Specialty, LLC

113 EA

LADDER, 3 FT. FIBERGLASS PODIUM+ PLATFORM STEP 
LADDER (9 FT. REACH HEIGHT) WITH 300 LBS. LOAD 
CAPACITY TYPE IA DUTY RATING, WERNER, PDIA03 WERNER

PDIA03

114 PACK
LINOLEUM PUSH TYPE CUTTER, NUMBER 3 LARGE 
LINER, PACK OF 12, SPEEDBALL SPEEDBALL $13.10 School Specialty, LLC

115 EA
LOOM, JACK RICHESON FLAT PEACOCK FINGER LOOM, 
10 X 12 INCHES JACK RICHESON SKU# 710403 $19.32 School Specialty, LLC

116 PKG

MAT, 5/PACKAGE, 1 OF EACH COLOR: YELLOW, RED, 
PURPLE, BLUE, GREEN, 19-5/8 IN. × 14-1/8 IN. GRID IN 3/4 
IN (2CM) SQUARES JACK RICHESON

401080
$13.39 School Specialty, LLC

117 EA
MIRROR, SELF-PORTRAIT, SINGLE-SIDED /FREE 
STANDING. 8-1/2 IN X 11 IN. 3 IN BASE SAX 405596 $9.92 Nasco Education LLC

118 EA
MODELING TOOL (PLASTIC),SPATULA FOR FLATTENING 
AND SMOOTHING BACKGROUND ST. LOUIS CRAFTS NO. H-35 $1.60 Nasco Education LLC

119 EA MODELING TOOL, LINEAR (PLASTIC) ST. LOUIS CRAFTS No. H-34 $1.60 Nasco Education LLC

120 EA
MODELING TOOL, PLASTIC, SPOON AND BALL-POINT 
TIPS FOR EMBOSSING OR MODELING ST. LOUIS CRAFTS No. H-37 $1.60 Nasco Education LLC

121 EA
NEEDLES, WEAVING-5 IN STEEL W/BLUNT POINT -EASY 
THREAD EYE. CHILD-SAFE $1.03 School Specialty, LLC

122 EA PALETTE 7-WELL FLOWER JACK RICHESON 400232 $3.16 School Specialty, LLC

123 EA
PAPER HOLE PUNCH, 1-HOLE, 1/4 IN, 10 SHEETS, 
NICKEL PLATED $0.73 School Specialty, LLC

124 EA
RACK BULMAN DELUXE ROLA 36 IN X 1000 FT 8 ROLLS 
UNASSEMBLED BULMAN

R371-DKD W/METAL 
DOWELS $869.85 School Specialty, LLC

125 EA

PAPER TRIMMER, STAKCUT WOOD BASE TRIMMER, 24 
INCH CUT, 30 SHEET CAPACITY, SAFETY 420ARM LOCK: 
PREMIER PREMIER $420.00 BLICK ART MATERIALS

126 SET CALLIGRAPHY BASIC SET OF 7 SPEEDBALL 2961 $7.84 School Specialty, LLC

127 EA
8 X 5.2 X 2.4 
DIFFERENT BRAND BAZIC STATIONARY #840 40236 $0.99 KURTZ BROS INC

128 PKG

STAPLES BRAND ASSORTED COLORS   QUILL ITEM 
211672 
https://www.quill.com/staples-manual-pencil-sharpener-
assorted-colors-10896-cc/cbs/55373662.html STAPLES

10896-CC

$2.62 Quill LLC

129 EA
PENCIL SHARPENER, ELECTRIC, AUTO-RESET, STEEL 5 
x 3 x 4 in., BLACK X-ACTO 1818QQQ $17.99 Quill LLC

130 EA

PENCIL SHARPENER, MODEL 41, HEAVY DUTY 
ELECTRIC WITH AUTO SHUT OFF, 11 X 2 X 7 IN., 
BEIGE/DARK GRAY X-ACTO

1606
$139.79 Cascade School Supplies

131 EA
PLASTI-BAT, LIGHTWEIGHT LONG LASTING ROUND, 12 
IN. AMACO 32331K $16.25 School Specialty, LLC

132 PACK
ROYLCO PLASTIC LACING NEEDLES, PKG OF 32, 3" 
LONG, LARGE EYE ROYLCO R5601 $3.05 BLICK ART MATERIALS

133 PACK
PLIERS, IMPORTED BOX JOINT PLIER KIT WITH PLASTIC 
CASE, 5-1/4 INCHES, PACK OF 5 $25.84 School Specialty, LLC

134 EA
GAGNE PORTA-TRACE LED LIGHT PANEL - DIMMABLE, 
12" X 17", BLACK GAGNE 1217-LP $177.21 School Specialty, LLC

135 EA
PORTFOLIO CASE - BLICK STUDIO SOFTSIDE 
PORTFOLIOS; BLACK 20"x26" BLICK #A16992-2020 $12.39 BLICK ART MATERIALS

136 SET POTTERY TOOL SET, ASSORTED SIZE, SET OF 8 JACK RICHESON 210570 $8.27 School Specialty, LLC

137 SET
POTTERY TOOL SET, SET OF 140 - 7 TOOLS, 20 EACH, 
PLASTIC; JACK RICHESON $41.56 School Specialty, LLC

138 Set
POTTERY TOOLS, DELUXE 12 PIECE BASIC POTTERS 
ASSORTMENT JACK RICHESON 210575 $29.78 BLICK ART MATERIALS

139 EA PRINTING PLATE, 9 IN. x 12 IN GELLI® GEL ARTS UPC  013964721027 $31.17 BLICK ART MATERIALS

140 EA

PRINTING PRESS, 19 IN MED MODEL 999 PRESS PKG. 
STEEL ROLLERS. 2 LEVELING DEVICES 1/4 IN THICK 
GRAY CUSHION BLANKET INCL. PRINTS UP TO 18 IN X 
34 IN. TOP ROLLER-4-1/8 IN DIAM, TO INCLUDE: PRESS, 
PLATE, BLANKET,STAND. INSIDE DELIVERY REQUIRED JACK RICHESON

SKU# 695301 
UPC: 717304079266

$2,432.82 Nasco Education LLC
141 EA PRO NEEDLE TOOL JACK RICHESON 210529 $1.88 School Specialty, LLC

142 EA

PUG MILL STAND, ADJUSTABLE WITH WHEELS FOR 
PETER PUGGER VPM-20 PUGMILL. ASSEMBLY NOT 
REQUIRED PETER PUGGER

143 EA
PUG MILL. INSIDE DELIVERY REQUIRED, ASSEMBLY 
NOT REQUIRED PETER PUGGER VPM-20

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Award
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144 SET
RASP SET, STEEL DOUBLE-SIDED, 8 IN. LONG FORGED, 
BLACK, SET OF 8, INCLUDES MESH STORAGE POUCH JACK RICHESON

210590
$18.55 School Specialty, LLC

145 EA

REHABILITATION POTTERS WHEEL. 1/3 HP MOTOR-
REVERSIBLE, VARIABLE SPEED FROM 0-200 RPM, CAST 
ALUM HEAD, NON-BREAKABLE SPLASH PAN. 2 YR 
LIMITED WARR. 47-3/4 IN W X 32 IN D W/ 12 IN HEAD. 310 
LBS. INSIDE DELIVERY REQUIRED, ASSEMBLY NOT 
REQUIRED AMACO ADAPTIVE

SKU 22666E Model 16

$4,360.00 BLICK ART MATERIALS
146 EA RICHESON TWISTED ETCHING TOOL, DOUBLE-ENDED JACK RICHESON $5.67 School Specialty, LLC

147 SET ROLLING PIN WOODEN 7 INCH PACK OF 12
MARVEL EDUCATION 
COMPANY MTC-272 $11.64 School Specialty, LLC

148 EA

ROLLING PIN. LARGE SIZE, ONE-PC SOLID HARDWOOD. 
KILN-DRIED MAPLE HARDWOOD, OIL TREATED. NO 
MOVING PARTS. 18 IN L W/ 10-1/2 IN ROLLER FALCON

305

149 EA RULER, ALUMINUM RULER, 36 INCHES JOHNSON J236 $3.61
MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY 
PRODUCTS

150 PKG
RULER, FLEXIBLE, 12 IN., PACK OF 36 (Sold per Dozen 
priced 36/pkg) SCHOOL SMART 2006544 $5.20 School Specialty, LLC

151 EA
RULER. 18 IN ALUM. EASY-TO-READ 
NUMBERS/CALIBRATIONS MAYES 10187 $2.09 School Specialty, LLC

152 EA
SCHOOL SMART LETTER SIZE CLIPBOARD, 9 X 12-1/2 
INCHES, HARDBOARD, BRIGHT NICKEL JACK RICHESON $0.68 School Specialty, LLC

153 SET SCISSORS, CLASS PACK, BLUNT TIP, 5IN, SET OF 12 FISKARS 194160-1070 $19.59 Quill LLC
154 EA SCISSORS, MULTIPURPOSE, 8 IN., COLORS MAY VARY FISKARS 12-94518697WJ $3.25 School Specialty, LLC

155 SET
SCISSORS, PAPER EDGER, 6-1/2 X 2-1/2 IN., ASSORTED 
COLORS, SET OF 24 SCHOOL SMART 85009 $23.24 School Specialty, LLC

156 PKG
SCISSORS, POINTED TIP KIDS, 5 IN., ASSORTED 
COLORS, PACK OF 12 FISKARS 1055801004 $11.39 Cascade School Supplies

157 EA SCISSORS, RED STUDENT, 7 IN. FISKARS 194580-1017 $2.68 KURTZ BROS INC

158 SET

SCRATCH TOOL SET - 7 INTERCHANGEABLE KNIVES 
MADE OF HIGH CARBON STEEL, HEAT TREATED TO 
RETAIN SHARPNESS, AND TO ELIMINATE RUST SHIMPO

VL-WHISPER

159 EA

SCREEN PRINTING FRAME, STANDARD -16 IN X 24 IN. 
FRAME 1-1/8 IN THICK W/12XX MULTIFILAMENT. BASE 
1/4 IN THICK HARD BRD. INCL 3 STAINLESS STEEL 
REGISTRATION GUIDES, SQUEEGEE AWT-EPU

1624-12

$87.55 BLICK ART MATERIALS

160 EA

SCREEN PRINTING FRAME, STANDARD -16 IN X 24 IN. 
FRAME 1-1/8 IN THICK W/12XX MULTIFILAMENT. BASE 
1/4 IN THICK HARD BRD. INCL 3 STAINLESS STEEL 
REGISTRATION GUIDES, SQUEEGEE.; AWT-EPU-1624-12 AWT

EPU-1624-12

$87.55 BLICK ART MATERIALS

161 EA
SCREENFLEX DISPLAY TOWERS, HEIGHT 6 FT. 5 IN. X 
WIDTH 3 FT. 1 IN., BLACK

SCREENFLEX DISPLAY 
TOWERS 1321914 $645.00 School Specialty, LLC

162 SET

SCREWDRIVER, GEARWRENCH 12-PIECE DUAL 
MATERIAL COMBINATION SCREWDRIVER SET, SET OF 
12 GEARWRENCH

GWR80051
$86.49 School Specialty, LLC

163 EA
Blick SELF HEALING MAT, 12 IN X 18 IN ONE IN SQ GRID 
PATTERN. Gray/Black BLICK 57559-2506 $5.65 BLICK ART MATERIALS

164 EA SELF-HEALING CUTTING MATT, GRAY/BLACK 18x24 BLICK 57559-2509 $10.32 BLICK ART MATERIALS
165 EA SHIMPO BANDING WHEEL, 8-3/4 X 2-1/4 IN., BLUE SHIMPO BW-22L $82.00 School Specialty, LLC

166 EA

SHIMPO VL WHISPER 1/2 HP POTTERY WHEEL, 23-1/8 X 
27-1/2 X 22-3/4 IN. ASSEMBLY REQUIRED. INSIDE 
DELIVERY REQUIRED SHIMPO

VL-WHISPER
$1,965.00 BLICK ART MATERIALS

167 EA
SKELETON, LIFE SIZE,MODEL OF A HUMAN SKELETON, 
MOVABLE LIMBS FREY SCIENTIFIC $270.83 School Specialty, LLC

168 EA

SKETCH BOARD, CLIP BOARD FOR SKETCHES,TWO 
HEAVY-DUTY CLIPS, BUILT IN HANDLE, 19 IN L X 19 IN 
W. SAUNDERS MFG.

5606

169 EA
SKETCH BOARD, TWO CLIPS, BUILT IN HANDLE, 23 IN. x 
26 IN. SAUNDERS MFG. 5607 $9.60 KURTZ BROS INC

170 EA

SLAB ROLLER, 24 IN. STANDARD PACKAGE (INCLUDES 
24 IN. SLAB ROLLER, 14 GAUGE STEEL CABLE, CANVAS 
& WAGON HANDLE). ASSEMBLY REQUIRED

NORTH STAR EQUIPMENT, 
INC

550

171 EA SPEEDBALL, CUTTER, HAND-ADJUSTED SCREW SPEEDBALL 004138 $3.80 Nasco Education LLC

172 PKG
SPEEDBALL, LINOLEUM PUSH TYPE CUTTER, NUMBER 
2 LARGE LINER, PACK OF 12 SPEEDBALL 004102 $13.10 School Specialty, LLC

173 EA
BAREN TEFLON SPEEDBALL 4-1/2 IN
SSL 380972

SPEEDBALL ART 
PRODUCTS CO LLC 004139 $17.06 School Specialty, LLC

174 EA

SQUEEGEE, 8 IN-URETHANE STAY-SHARP 75-
DUROMETER. URETHANE PLASTIC BLADE 2 IN X 3/8 IN 
THICK. WOODEN HANDLE: 4-5/8 IN X 7/8 IN 
W/REMOVABLE SCREWS. PROF. GRADE SPEEDBALL

004535

$10.97 School Specialty, LLC

175 EA

STAND, LIGHT, FOTOLITE STAND, 10 IN. DIA. HEAVY-
DUTY ALUMINUM REFLECTOR, SWIVEL. THREE-
SECTION 7-FT. ALUMINUM STAND WITH EASY-TO-
ADJUST KNOBS. USES BULBS UP TO 75 WATTS (NOT 
INCLUDED) TESTRITE VISUAL

124-3A1

$197.50 KURTZ BROS INC
176 EA DIFFERENT BRAND F.P.C. CORP #5600 13322 $13.24 KURTZ BROS INC

177 EA
STAPLER, LONG REACH. ADJ. PAPER STOP, EASY-TO-
READ ENGLISH METRIC RULERS. ANCHOR HOLES STANLEY BOSTITCH B440LR $16.96 Cascade School Supplies

178 EA
STAPLER. JAM PROOF. USES STANDARD STAPLES. 
PADDED GRIP. COLOR: BLACK SWINGLINE 747 $16.03 Cascade School Supplies

179 PKG STILT, AMACO LARGE POINTED STILT KIT, SET OF 60
AMERICAN ART CLAY CO 
INC 11288M $96.76 Nasco Education LLC

180 SET
STILT, AMACO SMALL POINTED STILT KIT, SET OF 30; 
AMERICAN ART CLAY CO INC /11287L AMACO 11287L $97.00 School Specialty, LLC

181 SET

STONE TOOL SET. STEEL, SET OF 6; INCLUDES: 1 
CHISEL, 1 POINT, 2 FLAT CHISELS, 1 ROUNDEL AND 1-
1/2 LB HAMMER IN A CANVAS ROLL FOR STORAGE SCULPTURE HOUSE

BAZ

182 EA STOOL, 18 in. SEAT HEIGHT NATIONAL PUBLIC SEATING 6218 $39.36 School Specialty, LLC

183 EA
STORAGE BIN 16 GALLON, CLEAR WITH BLACK LID, 
STOREX Storex $11.51 School Specialty, LLC

184 EA
STORAGE TRAY, 7-7/8 X 12-1/4 X 5-3/8 INCHES, CLEAR, 
SCHOOL SCHOOL SMART 279061 $3.38 School Specialty, LLC

185 EA
STORAGE TRAY, LETTER SIZE, 10-3/4 x 13-1/4 x 3 IN., 
TRANSLUCENT SCHOOL SMART 62512S05C $2.91 School Specialty, LLC

186 EA

TABLE, PORTA-TRACE LIGHT, SHATTER-RESIST, OPAL 
1/4 IN THICK PLEXIGLAS TOP. SOLID OAK FRAME 
MOUNTED ON WHITE BAKED ENAMEL LEGS W ADJ 
TILT. INCL. STAND. DAYLIGHT LAMPS. 24 x 36. INSIDE 
DELIVERY REQUIRED GAGNE

2436TC LED

$1,750.00 BLICK ART MATERIALS
187 EA TACKING IRON - EXPRESSION SEALECTOR III EXPRESSION Model #: 2280 $174.15 BLICK ART MATERIALS

188 EA
TAPE DISPENSER WITH INTERCHANGEABLE 1 AND 3 IN. 
CORES, BLACK SCHOOL SMART A2729 $1.25 School Specialty, LLC

189 EA TAPE DISPENSER, 1 INCH CORE, NONSKID, BLACK SCHOOL SMART 040617 $1.00 School Specialty, LLC

190 EA
TONGS, COPPER, 9 IN. LONG. FOR USE W/SPAREX 
WHEN CLEANING SILVER ESSLINGER 57.052

191 PACK
TOTE CADDY, Small Caddy, 9-1/4 x 9-1/4 x 5-1/4 Inches, 
Red, Pack of 6, Storex Storex $9.65 School Specialty, LLC

192 PKG
TRANSPARENCIES, 1 IN. DRAWING GRID, 8 1/2 X 11 IN., 
PKG. 25 NASCO 9732063 $25.56 Nasco Education LLC

193 PKG
TRANSPARENCIES, 1/2 IN. DRAWING GRID, 8 1/2 IN. X11 
IN. , PKG. 25 NASCO 9732064 $25.96 Nasco Education LLC

194 EA
TRAY, INKING & AMP PAINT, 12 X 16 IN, 
POLYPROPYLENE, RED. VOLRATH 86110 $6.25 Nasco Education LLC

195 EA
TRAY, INKING & AMP PAINT, 12 X 16 IN, 
POLYPROPYLENE, ROYAL BLUE VOLRATH 86117 $6.25 Nasco Education LLC

196 EA
TRAY, INKING & AMP PAINT, 12 X 16 IN, 
POLYPROPYLENE, TEAL. VOLRATH 86119

197 SET
TRAY, MULTI COLOR, 15 X 10-1/2 IN., ASSORTED 
COLORS, SET OF 5 JACK RICHESON 400995 $15.99 BLICK ART MATERIALS

198 EA
TRAY, PAINT, ROUND, 7-7/8 IN DIAMETER TRAYS W/10 
MIXING WELLS. PLASTIC. WITH COVERS JACK RICHESON 400220-12

199 EA TRAY, STOCK, L14 x W12 x H4 IN., CLEAR SHIRLEY KS8 T183 $12.21 School Specialty, LLC
200 EA TRAY, STOCK, L19 IN x W13 3/4 IN x H3 1/2 IN, TAN SHIRLEY KS8 T105 $11.22 School Specialty, LLC
201 EA TRAY, STOCK, L19 x W9 x H43/8 IN. TAN SHIRLEY KS8 T100 $14.00 School Specialty, LLC

202 EA
TRIANGLE, STUDENT GRADE POLYSTRENE, 30 AND 60 
DEGREES, 10 IN., CLEAR WESTCOTT S390-10 INCH $1.65 School Specialty, LLC

203 EA BLICK STANDARD ALUMINUM T-SQUARE 24" BLICK 56000-1024 $8.23 BLICK ART MATERIALS
204 EA TUFF TRUCK™ SMALL PLATFORM TRUCK SAFCO Model 4072 $135.00 BLICK ART MATERIALS

205 EA

UTILITY SNIPS, ALL PURPOSE, METAL, STAINLESS 
STEEL BLADES W/OFFSET HANDLES. MOLDED, 
PLASTIC HANDLES. 7 IN LONG HYGLO $4.40 Nasco Education LLC

206 PKG
WEAVING LOOM, CARDBOARD, 6 1/2 x 13 IN., GRAY, 
PACK OF 12 JACK RICHESON 787954 $8.08 School Specialty, LLC

207 PACK
WEAVING LOOM, CARDBOARD, 6 1/2 x 13 IN., GRAY, 
PACK OF 13 JACK RICHESON 787955

208 PKG
WEAVING LOOM, WIDE NOTCHED STUDENT, 3-1/4 IN X 
13 IN, GRAY, PACK OF 12 JACK RICHESON 787951 $4.58 School Specialty, LLC

209 EA
WEDGING BOARD, XIEM X-BOARD WEDGING BOARD - 
MEDIUM, 24" X 24", X10089 XIEM X10089 $74.90 BLICK ART MATERIALS

210 EA

WEDGING/RECYCLE TABLE PRO, DIMENSIONS 38 IN. W 
X 18 IN. D X 33 IN HIGH. TABLE IS MADE TO ORDER. 
INSIDE DELIVERY REQUIRED THE CERAMIC SHOP

CSWRS

211 EA

WOODEN COUNTER BRUSH, 3-1/4 long bristles are made 
of 50 percent horsehair and 50 percent polystyrene, The 
brush portion measures 8 x 1-3/4. IMPERIAL DADE

3622523
$5.99 Cascade School Supplies

212 EA
WOOL BLANKET - MEDIUM, GRAY, 18 IN X 36 IN X 1/4 IN 
CUSHION BLANKET JACK RICHESON 695304 $45.48 BLICK ART MATERIALS

213 EA
WOOL BLANKET - MEDIUM, WHITE, 18 IN X 36 IN X 1/16 
IN CATCHER BLANKET JACK RICHESON 695309 $27.57 BLICK ART MATERIALS

214 EA
WOOL BLANKET - MEDIUM, WHITE, 18 IN X 36 IN X 1/8 IN 
PUSHER BLANKET JACK RICHESON 695308 $36.91 BLICK ART MATERIALS
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